ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT FOR
ROAD MATERIALS
BID NUMBER 2026.02

AWARD
December 10, 2025

December 10, 2025, Calhoun County Commissioners Court awarded the bids for the Annual
Supply Contract for Road Materials for the period beginning January 1, 2026 and ending
December 31, 2026.

See Bid Tabulation for Awarded Bids



CALHOUN COUNTY, TEXAS

AWARDED BID TABULATION

ROAD MATERIALS

ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT, BID NUMBER: 2026.02
For the Period Beginning January 1, 2026 and Ending December 31, 2026

3.350 BASELINE PRICE ON MONDAY, OCTOBER 27, 2025 FOR DIESEL FUEL ADJUSTMENT ON DELIVERY PRICE
(www.eia.gov/petroleum/gasdiesel) (Gulf Coast Area)

ROAD MATERIALS

Bid Item #1: Limestone - 1/2 Inch to Dust or Equivalent

BIDDER ; MINIMUM
LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL BID PLACEMENT
AND REMARKS, IF ANY LOAD/ORDER
QUALITY HOT MIX, INC. Precinct 1 Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
REMARKS: Precinct 2 Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP
i LOWEST BID
TRAILERS. BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN Precinct 3 Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF Precinct 4-P Ton $14.00 $27.50 $41.50 24 TONS
AVAILABLE
Precinct 4-S Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
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Bid Item #2: Limestone - 3/4 Inch to Dust or Equivalent

BIDDER . MINIMUM
LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL BID PLACEMENT
AND REMARKS, IF ANY ! I.OAD/ORDER
Precinct 1 Ton $8.00 $29.10 $37.10 25 TONS AWARDED BID
Precinct 2 Ton $8.00 $29.10 $37.10 25 TONS AWARDED BID
K-C LEASE SERVICE, INC. DBA
MATAGORDA CONSTRUCTION & |pecinct 3 Ton $8.00 $30.10 $38.10 25 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
MATERIALS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
Precinct 4-P Ton $8.00 $32.60 $40.60 25 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $8.00 $29.60 $37.60 25 TONS AWARDED BID
. AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 1 Ton $6.75 $31.10 $37.85 25 TONS
AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
MAREK & MAREK Precinct 2 Ton $6.75 $31.10 $37.85 25 TONS
TRUCK WASH, INC.
Precinct 3 T 6.75 30.00 36.75 25 TONS LOWEST BID
DBA FRANK MAREK TRUCKING o > > >
Precinct 4-P Ton $6.75 $31.50 $38.25 25 TONS LOWEST BID
Precinct 4-S Ton $6.75 $31.10 $37.85 25 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 1 Ton $14.00 $24.50 $38.50 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
QUALITY HOT MIX; INC. , AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
REMARKS: Precinct 2 Ton $14.00 $24.50 $38.50 24 TONS
ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP
TRAILERS. BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN |Precinct 3 Ton $14.00 $24.50 $38.50 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF ALTERNATE #1
AVAILABLE Precinct 4-P Ton $14.00 $24.50 $38.50 24 TONS
AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
Precinct 4-S Ton $14.00 $24.50 $38.50 24 TONS
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Bid Item #3: Item 247, Type A Limestone, Grade 2 [1 3/4 Inch] or Equivalent

BIDDER . MINIMUM
AND REMIARKS, IF ANY LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL LOAD/ORDER BID PLACEMENT
Precinct 1 Ton $7.75 $29.10 $36.85 25 TONS AWARDED LOWEST BID
Precinct 2 Ton $7.75 $29.10 $36.85 25 TONS AWARDED LOWEST BID
K-C LEASE SERVICE, INC.
dba MATAGORDA Precinct 3 Ton $7.75 $30.10 $37.85 25 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
CONSTRUCTION & MATERIALS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
Precinct 4-P Ton $7.75 $32.60 $40.35 25 TONS

Precinct 4-S Ton $7.75 $29.60 $37.35 25 TONS AWARDED LOWEST BID
Precinct 1 Ton $6.60 $31.10 $37.70 25 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
MAREK & MAREK Precinct 2 Ton $6.60 $31.10 $37.70 25 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1

TRUCK WASH, INC. Precinct 3 Ton $6.60 $30.00 $36.60 25 TONS LOWEST BID
DBA FRANK MAREK TRUCKING
Precinct 4-P Ton $6.60 $31.50 $38.10 25 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 4-S Ton $6.60 $31.10 $37.70 25 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 1 Ton $14.00 $24.00 $38.00 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
QUALITY HOT MIX, INC.
REMARKS: Precinct 2 Ton $14.00 $24.00 $38.00 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP
TRAILERS. BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN |precinct 3 Ton $14.00 $24.00 $38.00 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF
AVAILABLE Precinct 4-P Ton $14.00 $24.00 $38.00 24 TONS LOWEST BID

Precinct 4-S Ton $14.00 $24.00 $38.00 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
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Bid Item #4: Item 247, Type A Limestone, Grade 3 [1 3/4 Inch] or Equivalent

AND REBI\I/ITF?IESF,{IF ANY LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL I.(')vll-\lg;“g:lxR BID PLACEMENT
Precinct 1 Ton $7.00 $28.00 $35.00 24 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton $7.00 $28.00 $35.00 24 TONS
COLORADO MATERIALS, LTD  (precinct 3 Ton $7.00 $30.00 $37.00 24 TONS LOWEST BID
Precinct 4-P Ton $7.00 $32.00 $39.00 24 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $7.00 $30.00 $37.00 24 TONS
QUALITY HOT MIX, INC. Precinct 1 Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
REMARKS: Precinct 2 Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
T&ts:;_l\éiﬁiss\:;:,NTEZIIDLE;“QPAN Precinct 3 Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #1
BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF Precinct 4-P Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
AVAILABLE Precinct 4-S Ton $14.00 $26.00 $40.00 24 TONS
Bid Item #5: Item 265-2.2 Fly Ash or Equivalent
Fly Ash that meets the requirements of DMS 4615 "Fly Ash for Soil Treatment" Class CS or FS
Delivered in pneumatic tankers with spreader bar
AND REBI\I/IT:IE:W ANY LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL LO“TQIS;“(;I:I::IER BID PLACEMENT
Precinct 1 Ton $60.00 $120.00 $180.00 25 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton $60.00 $120.00 $180.00 25 TONS
MIDTEX MATERIALS, LLC Precinct 3 Ton $60.00 $120.00 $180.00 25 TONS LOWEST BID
Precinct 4-P Ton $60.00 $120.00 $180.00 25 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $60.00 $120.00 $180.00 25 TONS
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Bid Item #6: Item 275, Cement or Equivalent

275-2.1, Hydraulic Cement Type 1, Bulk (Pneumatic Tankers, Spreader Bar Needed)

275.2-1, Hydraulic Cement Type 1, 47 |b Bag (Cost per Pallet) List # of 47 Ib Bags on a Pallet

BIDDER . MINIMUM
LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL BID PLACEMENT
AND REMARKS, IF ANY LOAD/ORDER
Precinct 1 TON $190.00 $88.00 $278.00 25 TONS
of 47
Ib Bags on NO BID
Pallet
Precinct 2 TON $190.00 $88.00 $278.00 25 TONS
of 47
Ib Bags on NO BID
Pallet
Precinct 3 TON $190.00 $88.00 $278.00 25 TONS
of 47
— LOWEST BID
MIDTEX MATERIALS, LLC b Bags on NO BID
Pallet
Precinct 4-P TON $190.00 $88.00 $278.00 25 TONS
__of471lb
Bags on NO BID
Pallet
Precinct 4-S TON $190.00 $88.00 $278.00 25 TONS
of 47
Ib Bags on NO BID
Pallet
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Bid Item #7: Item 302, Type PB, Grade 3 (Pre-Coated Rock) or Equivalent

BIDDER MINIMUM
LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL

AND REMARKS, IF ANY n LOAD/ORDER BID PLACEMENT
Precinct 1 Ton $55.00 $28.00 $83.00 24 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton $55.00 $28.00 $83.00 24 TONS

COLORADO MATERIALS, LTD (Precinct 3 Ton $55.00 $30.00 $85.00 24 TONS LOWEST BID
Precinct 4-P Ton $55.00 $32.00 $87.00 24 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $55.00 $30.00 $85.00 24 TONS
QUALITY HOT MiIX, INC. Precinct 1 Ton $68.00 $18.00 $86.00 25 TONS
REMARKS: Precinct 2 Ton $68.00 $18.00 $86.00 25 TONS
ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP

i ALTERNATE #1
TRAILERS. BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN LPrecinct 3 Ton $68.00 $18.00 $86.00 25 TONS
BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF Precinct 4-P Ton $68.00 $21.00 $89.00 25 TONS
AVAILABLE Precinct 4-S Ton $68.00 $20.00 $88.00 25 TONS
Precinct 1 Ton $44.00 $53.90 $97.90 24 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton 44.00 55.00 99.00 24 TONS

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION - > > > ALTERNATE #2
MATERIALS, LLC Precinct 3 Ton $44.00 $57.20 $101.20 24 TONS
Precinct 4-P Ton $44.00 $55.00 $99.00 24 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $44.00 $55.00 $99.00 24 TONS
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Bid Item #8: Item 302, Type PB, Grade 4 (Pre-Coated Rock) or Equivalent

BIDDER MINIMUM
LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL
AND REMARKS, IF ANY n LOAD/ORDER BID PLACEMENT
Precinct 1 Ton $55.00 $28.00 $83.00 24 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton $55.00 $28.00 $83.00 24 TONS
COLORADO MATERIALS, LTD (Precinct 3 Ton $55.00 $30.00 $85.00 24 TONS LOWEST BID
Precinct 4-P Ton $55.00 $32.00 $87.00 24 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $55.00 $30.00 $85.00 24 TONS
QUALITY HOT MiIX, INC. Precinct 1 Ton $68.00 $18.00 $86.00 25 TONS
REMARKS: Precinct 2 Ton $68.00 $18.00 $86.00 25 TONS
ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP -
TRAILERS. BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN Precinct 3 Ton $68.00 $18.00 $86.00 25 TONS ALTERNATE #1
BE REQUESTED & PROVIDED IF Precinct 4-P Ton $68.00 $21.00 $89.00 25 TONS
AVAILABLE Precinct 4-S Ton $68.00 $20.00 $88.00 25 TONS
Precinct 1 Ton $44.00 $53.90 $97.90 24 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton 44.00 55.00 99.00 24 TONS
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION - > > > ALTERNATE #2
MATERIALS, LLC Precinct 3 Ton $44.00 $57.20 $101.20 24 TONS
Precinct 4-P Ton $44.00 $55.00 $99.00 24 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $44.00 $55.00 $99.00 24 TONS
Bid Item #9: Item 302, Type PE, Grade 3 (Pre-Coated Rock)
*Material Source out of * or Equivalent
BIDDER . MINIMUM
LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL BID PLACEMENT
AND REMARKS, IF ANY n LOAD/ORDER c
Precinct | | -
NO BIDS RECEIVED 1,2,3, oo | e
4-P&4-S | | o ee----mmTTTTTTOO T e
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Bid Item #10: Item 302, Type PE, Grade 4 (Pre-Coated Rock)
* or Equivalent

*Material Source out of

BIDDER . MINIMUM
AND REMARKS, IF ANY LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL LOAD/ORDER BID PLACEMENT
Precinct | | TTTce-——e_____ e
NO BIDS RECEIVED 1,23, L2 e
aP&aAs | | T e

Bid Item #11: Item 302, Type E, Grade 5, Ice Rock (Non Coated Limestone Only) or Equivalent

AND R:“;[:\EIE:IF ANY LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL Lc';’/';g;“é':DNE'R BID PLACEMENT
Precinct 1 Ton $25.20 $29.10 $54.30 25 TONS
K-C LEASE SERVICE, INC. Precinct 2 Ton $25.20 $29.10 $54.30 25 TONS
dba MATAGORDA Precinct 3 Ton $25.20 $30.10 $55.30 25 TONS LOWEST BID
CONSTRUCTION & MATERIALS |precinct4-P | Ton $25.20 $32.60 $57.80 25 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $25.20 $29.60 $54.80 25 TONS
Precinct 1 Ton $35.00 $28.00 $63.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 2 Ton $35.00 $28.00 $63.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #1
COLORADO MATERIALS, LTD Precinct 3 Ton $35.00 $30.00 $65.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 4-P Ton $35.00 $32.00 $67.00 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 4-S Ton $35.00 $30.00 $65.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #1
QUALITY HOT MIX, INC. Precinct 1 Ton $30.00 $37.00 $67.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #2
REMARKS: Precinct 2 Ton $30.00 $37.00 $67.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #2
ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END DUMP  |Precinct 3 Ton $30.00 $37.00 $67.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #2
TRAILERS. BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN
BE REQUEZI/EA?Li;L"EOV'DED P Iprecinct 4-P Ton $30.00 $37.00 $67.00 24 TONS AWARDED ALTERNATE #2
Precinct 4-S Ton $30.00 $37.00 $67.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #2
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Bid Item #12: Item 330, Type D (Pre-Mix Limestone) or Equivalent

BIDDER . MINIMUM
LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL BID PLACEMENT
AND REMARKS, IF ANY n LOAD/ORDER
Precinct 1 Ton $78.00 $53.90 $131.90 24 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton 78.00 55.00 133.00 24 TONS
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION > > > LOWEST BID
i . . . 24 TONS
MATERIALS, LLC Precinct 3 Ton $78.00 $57.20 $135.20

Precinct 4-P Ton $78.00 $55.00 $133.00 24 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $78.00 $55.00 $133.00 24 TONS

Bid Item #13: Item 330, Type D, Pothole Repair, Limestone Rock Asphalt (LRA) or Equivalent

BIDDER . MINIMUM
AND REMARKS, IF ANY LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL LOAD/ORDER BID PLACEMENT
*Doesn’t qualify for fuel adjustment due to no delivery/material price
Precinct 1 Ton NO BID
ASPHALT PATCH 50 Ib Bag N (S)lB7I.;4 | 56 BAGS LOWEST BID
. Ton
ENTERPRISES, INC. Precinct 21— Bag 51744 | 56 BAGS LOWEST BID
REMARKS: Precinct 3 Ton NO BID
60LB BAGS/ 56 BAGS PER PALLET/ 50 Ib Bag $17.44 | 56 BAGS LOWEST BID
SEE BROCHURES Precinct 4-P Ton NO BID
WEBSITE: ASPHALTPATCHHP.COM 50 |b Bag $17.44 | 56 BAGS LOWEST BID
Precinct 4-S Ton NO BID
50 Ib Bag $17.44 | 56 BAGS LOWEST BID
*Doesn’t qualify for fuel adjustment due to no delivery/material price
Precinct 1 Ton $197.95 /TON 24 TONS LOWEST BID
50 Ib Bag $20.00 / BAG 62 BAGS ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 2 Ton $198.25 / TON 24 TONS LOWEST BID
50 |b Bag $20.00 / BAG 62 BAGS ALTERNATE #1
BLADES GROUP LLC Precinct 3 Ton $202.30 / TON 24 TONS LOWEST BID
50 |b Bag $20.00 / BAG 62 BAGS ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 4-P Ton $203.85 / TON 24 TONS LOWEST BID
50 |b Bag $20.00 / BAG 62 BAGS ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 4-S Ton $197.95 /TON 24 TONS LOWEST BID
50 Ib Bag $20.00 / BAG 62 BAGS ALTERNATE #1
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Bid Item #14: Item 334, Type D, Hot Mix Cold Laid Asphalt Concrete Pavement or Equivalent

AND REBI\;DAEKE:IF ANY LOCATION Unit MATERIAL DELIVERY TOTAL L('::,/I\IS%I;;WER BID PLACEMENT
Precinct 1 Ton $80.00 $28.00 $108.00 24 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton $80.00 $28.00 $108.00 24 TONS

COLORADO MATERIALS, LTD  |precinct 3 Ton $80.00 $30.00 $110.00 24 TONS LOWEST BID

Precinct 4-P Ton $80.00 $32.00 $112.00 24 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $80.00 $30.00 $110.00 24 TONS
Precinct 1 Ton $102.00 $14.00 $116.00 25 TONS
QUALITYR::,IC‘::K:Y"X' INC. Precinct 2 Ton $102.00 $14.00 $116.00 25 TONS

ALL DELIVERIES ARE IN END-DUMP TRAILERS. [Precinct 3 Ton $102.00 $15.00 $117.00 25 TONS ALTERNATE #1

BELLY DUMP TRAILERS CAN BE REQUESTED &

PROVIDED IF AVAILABLE Precinct 4-P Ton $102.00 $17.00 $119.00 25 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $102.00 $16.00 $118.00 25 TONS

Intentionally Left Blank
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Bid Item #15: ASPPM 9202 Grade IV High Performance Cold Mix or Equivalent

BIDDER . MINIMUM
LOCATION MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL
AND REMARKS, IF ANY OCATIO Unit 0 LOAD/ORDER BID PLACEMENT
ASPHALT PATCH ENTERPRISES, |precinct 1 Ton $130.63 $28.00 $158.63 25 TONS
INC. Precinct 2 Ton $130.63 $28.00 $158.63 25 TONS
REMARKS:
MANUFACTURED UNDER TXDOT 9202 |Precinct 3 Ton $130.63 $28.00 $158.63 25 TONS LOWEST BID
SPECIFICATIONS USING SCM1 OIL, WITH A R ) ONS
VIODIFIED GRADE 4 GRADATION Precinct 4-P Ton $130.63 $39.00 $169.63 5TON
WEBSITE: ASPHALTPATCHHP.COM Precinct 4-S Ton $130.63 $39.00 $169.63 25 TONS
Precinct 1 Ton $120.00 $40.40 $160.40 1 LOAD ALTERNATE #1
MAREK & MAREK Precinct 2 Ton $120.00 $40.40 $160.40 1 LOAD ALTERNATE #1
TRUCK WASH, INC. Precinct 3 Ton $120.00 $39.15 $159.15 1 LOAD ALTERNATE #1
DBA FRANK MAREK TRUCKING Precinct 4-P Ton $120.00 $50.50 $170.50 1 LOAD ALTERNATE #2
Precinct 4-S Ton $120.00 $50.50 $170.50 1 LOAD ALTERNATE #2
Precinct 1 Ton $110.00 $50.92 $160.92 25 TONS ALTERNATE #2
Precinct 2 Ton $110.00 $50.92 $160.92 25 TONS ALTERNATE #2
WALLER COUNTY - ALTERNATE #2
ASHPALT, INC. Precinct 3 Ton $110.00 $49.40 $159.40 25 TONS
Precinct 4-P Ton $110.00 $60.80 $170.80 25 TONS ALTERNATE #3
Precinct 4-S Ton $110.00 $60.80 $170.80 25 TONS ALTERNATE #3
Precinct 1 Ton $115.00 $53.90 $168.90 24 TONS ALTERNATE #3
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION  (precinct 2 Ton $115.00 $55.00 $170.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #3
MA‘LES';';Z Le Precinct 3 Ton $115.00 $57.20 $172.20 24 TONS ALTERNATE #3
BIDDING AS PATCH PRO Precinct 4-P Ton $115.00 $55.00 $170.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #1
Precinct 4-S Ton $115.00 $55.00 $170.00 24 TONS ALTERNATE #1
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Bid Item #16: Item 432 Riprap, Section 2.3 Stone Riprap, 12" Limestone or Equivalent

BIDDER LOCATION Unit MATERIAL | DELIVERY TOTAL MINIMUM BIDDER
AND REMARKS, IF ANY LOAD/ORDER AND REMARKS, IF ANY
Precinct 1 Ton $32.00 $87.00 $119.00 25 TONS
Precinct 2 Ton $32.00 $87.00 $119.00 25 TONS
MIDTEX MATERIALS, LLC Precinct 3 Ton $32.00 $87.00 $119.00 25 TONS LOWEST BID
Precinct 4-P Ton $32.00 $87.00 $119.00 25 TONS
Precinct 4-S Ton $32.00 $87.00 $119.00 25 TONS
WRITE IN BID
Bid Item #13: Item 330, Type D, Pothole Repair, Limestone Rock Asphalt (LRA) or Equivalent
Precinct 1 2400 Ibs $526.00 / each 3 min
Precinct 2 2400 Ibs $526.00 / each 3 min
BLADES GROUP LLC
REMARKS: Precinct 3 2400 lbs $526.00 / each 3 min LOWEST BID
This is a write in for our 1 cuyd
supersacks Precinct 4-P | 2400 lbs $526.00 / each 3 min
Precinct 4-S | 2400 lbs $526.00 / each 3 min
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